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RESOLUTION CONCERNING THE SELECTION OF AN INSURANCE 

CARRIER REPRESENTATIVE  FOR  THE TOWN OF GREENVILLE 

AND GREENVILLE MUNICIPAL WATER AND SEWER UTILITY OF 

GREENVILLE INDIANA FROM SEPTEMBER 1
ST

 , 2013 THROUGH 

AUGUST 31
st
, 2014 

 
WHEREAS, the Greenville Municipal Water and Sewer Utility Council for the Town of 

Greenville, Indiana, is the entity for fixing of compensation and benefits for all employees of the 

Greenville Water Utility pursuant to IC 8-1.5-3-4 and; 

 

WHEREAS, in the interest of providing the Greenville Municipal Water and Sewer Utility and 

Town of Greenville with quality commercial insurance coverage at the most cost effective 

premiums. The Greenville Town Council and Greenville Water Utility Council for the Town of 

Greenville, Indiana requested quotations from ISU Insurance and Investment Group Michael 

Whalen Agent and Neace-Lukens Insurance Group and; 

 

WHEREAS, Neace-Lukens Insurance Group declined to bid {see e-mail attached};   

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GRENVILLE MUNICIPAL WATER AND 

SEWER UTILITY COUNCIL OF THE TOWN OF GREENVILLE, INDIANA, AS FOLLOWS: 

 

1. Insurance Policies issued by ISU Mike Whalen Agent shall be effective from September 1
st
, 

2013 through and to include August 31
st
, 2014. 

 

2. Commercial Package shall include the following; 

 Property 

 General Liability 

 Employee Benefits Liability 

 Wrongful Acts Liability 

 Law Enforcement Liability 

 Auto  

 Inland Marine 

 Crime 

 Umbrella 

 

3. ISU Mike Whalen Agent shall provide to the Greenville Municipal Water and Sewer Utility 

Clerk / Treasurer a minimum of 60 days prior to renewal date premium renewal notices. The 

Greenville Water Utility and Town of Greenville shall acquire at least one competitive bid for the 

same coverage of insurance if a premium increase is indicated for the September 1
st
, 2013 

through and to include August 31
st
, 2014 calendar year. The Greenville Water Utility Clerk / 

Treasurer shall submit the new bid along with the renewal premiums for the current insurance 

provider representative to the Greenville Municipal Water and Sewer Utility and Town Council 

at their August 2014 Monthly Meeting. 

 

















































TOG/GREENVILLE WATER - BILLING BREAKDOWN 2013

Town Water Total Premium

Gen Liab 230.91 Gen Liab 843.09 1,074.00

Umbrella 107.50 Umbrella 392.50 500.00

Equipment 0.00 Equipment 115.00 115.00

Auto Liab 712.00 Auto Liab 712.00 1,424.00

Auto PD 820.00 Auto PD 820.00 1,640.00

Property 273.69 Property 2,767.31 3,041.00

Crime 20.85 Crime 76.15 97.00

E & O 500.00 500.00

Law 812.00 812.00

Blanket Bonds 146.00 146.00

Terrorism 100.00 Terrorism 100.00 200.00

0.00

Totals 3,722.95 Totals 5,826.05 9,549.00



 
rajohnes  

From: "johnesdrafting" <johnesdrafting@insightbb.com>
To: "'Mike Whalen'" <MikeW@isu-iig.com>
Cc: "Greenville Water Utility Superintendent Getrost" <super-gre-water@insightbb.com>; "Greenville 

Water Utility Office Manager Stone" <amy-greenville-water@insightbb.com>; "Greenville Councilman 
Redden" <gregsredden@gmail.com>; "Greenville Councilman Kepley" <kepexc@yahoo.com>; 
"Greenville Councilman Bob Wright" <jwright11@insightbb.com>; "Greenville Council Woman Hayes" 
<Pattiahayes@aol.com>; "Greenville Council President Richardson" 
<C.Richardson2@insightbb.com>; "Greenville Attorney Chris Lane" <lanelawoffice@gmail.com>; 
"Greenville Clerk Travillian" <greenville-clerk@insightbb.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2013 2:00 PM
Attach: LossRun4.pdf; LOSS RUNS 5585C833 9-1-2012.pdf
Subject: Liability Coverage
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05-29-2013 
  
Mr. Whalen, 
  
This e-mail is an invitation to bid for the Liability Coverage for the Water Utility and Town of Greenville to be 
renewed on 9-1-2013. You may inquire from Amy Stone  812-923-9821 any information you may require. It is to 
be noted that we have added a New Water Tower {$850,000}, New Pumping Station {$660,000} and the Sewer 
Plant in Heritage Springs {$650,000} since last year. We have also had two Water Tanks removed because the 
new Water Tank replaced both of them. 
  
I have attached the Run-Loss for 2012-2013. 
  
I need to receive your bid no later than 8-5-13 to allow me time to prepare my Resolution for the August Monthly 
Meeting. I hope this early notification will give you sufficient time to prepare your bid. 
  
Thank You, 
Randal Johnes 
Town Manager 
Greenville, Indiana  



 
rajohnes  

From: "johnesdrafting" <johnesdrafting@insightbb.com>
To: "Rick Zoeller" <rick.zoeller@neacelukens.com>
Cc: "Greenville Councilman Redden" <gregsredden@gmail.com>; "Greenville Councilman Kepley" 

<kepexc@yahoo.com>; "Greenville Councilman Bob Wright" <jwright11@insightbb.com>; "Greenville 
Council Woman Hayes" <Pattiahayes@aol.com>; "Greenville Attorney Chris Lane" 
<lanelawoffice@gmail.com>; "Greenville Clerk Travillian" <greenville-clerk@insightbb.com>; 
"Greenville Water Utility Office Manager Stone" <amy-greenville-water@insightbb.com>; "Greenville 
Water Utility Superintendent Getrost" <super-gre-water@insightbb.com>; "Greenville Council 
President Richardson" <C.Richardson2@insightbb.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2013 1:58 PM
Attach: LossRun4.pdf; LOSS RUNS 5585C833 9-1-2012.pdf
Subject: Liability Coverage
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05-29-2013 
  
Mr. Zoeller, 
  
This e-mail is an invitation to bid for the Liability Coverage for the Water Utility and Town of Greenville to be 
renewed on 9-1-2013. You may inquire from Amy Stone  812-923-9821 any information you may require. It is to 
be noted that we have added a New Water Tower {$850,000}, New Pumping Station {$660,000} and the Sewer 
Plant in Heritage Springs {$650,000} since last year. We have also had two Water Tanks removed because the 
new Water Tank replaced both of them. 
  
I have attached the Run-Loss for 2012-2013. 
  
I need to receive your bid no later than 8-5-13 to allow me time to prepare my Resolution for the August Monthly 
Meeting. I hope this early notification will give you sufficient time to prepare your bid. 
  
Thank You, 
Randal Johnes 
Town Manager 
Greenville, Indiana  



 
rajohnes  

From: "Amy Stone" <amy-greenville-water@insightbb.com>
To: "'rajohnes'" <rajohnes@twc.com>
Sent: Friday, August 09, 2013 11:31 AM
Subject: FW: Property & Casualty Quote
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Hi Randy, 
  
Please read/// 
  
Thanks, 
Amy 
  

From: Scott Peyton [mailto:scott.peyton@neacelukens.com]  
Sent: Friday, August 09, 2013 11:20 AM 
To: Amy Stone 
Cc: Mike Jenkins; Erin Mason 
Subject: Property & Casualty Quote 
  
Hi Amy, 
  
I wanted to let you know that we will not have a competitive quote for you and explain to you what transpired 
here.  I believe Mike Jenkins has spoken with Randy as well. 
  
The other day when you forwarded me the email with loss runs attached that Randy had sent back in May was the 
first time I ever saw that.  I noticed that it had a need by date of 8/5 as well.  That explains why you e‐mailed me on 
Monday to inquire about your quote.  Mike & I met with you and the others on 7/29 and I was under the 
impression that we were starting from scratch on that day which is why I was somewhat confused as to why you 
were asking about your quote one week later. 
  

Amy, I apologize for putting you, Gary & Talbot through all of that back on the 29th.  I have no idea why the process 
wasn’t started approx. 90 days ago when Randy first sent the email over.  I was able to submit the information to 
two different carriers.  One of those carriers, Selective Insurance, was able to turn around a quote to us late last 
night.  It is not competitive even with the changes to this year’s coverage.  The other carrier could not deliver 
simply because they didn’t receive the submission until last week.  It’s embarrassing to Mike & I to say the least 
that we did not know what had transpired prior to either of us getting involved.  It doesn’t portray a very 
professional image which probably bothers me as much as wasting your time.  If you ever decide to let Neace 
Lukens look at this again, please let Mike and/or I know and we will get started on it with the appropriate amount 
of lead time needed to secure a competitive quote and do it correctly. 
  
Thank you Amy & have a nice weekend, 
  
SCOTT PEYTON I SENIOR ACCOUNT EXECUTIVE 
 
NEACE LUKENS I An AssuredPartners Company 
2325 Green Valley Rd, Suite 205, New Albany, IN 47150  
P  812.941.4147    F  812.944.8010    C  812.457.3056     
scott.peyton@neacelukens.com    neacelukens.com       LinkedIn      Facebook     Blog 
  
The information contained herein, including any attachments, is proprietary and confidential and is intended for the exclusive use of the addressee.  It also 
may contain privileged information and/or personal information subject to privacy legislation.  The authorized addressee of this information, by its retention 
and use, agrees to protect the information contained herein from loss, theft, or compromise with at least the same care it employs to protect its own 
confidential information.  Any dissemination or use of this information by a person other than the intended recipient is unauthorized and may be illegal.  If 
you have received this e-mail in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply e-mail and destroy all copies. 
  


